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In a world on the brink of chaos, only two people can balance opposing forces and restore order to the
universe. To do so, the two must forge an intimate bond. Unfortunately, they’re complete opposites who are
unaware of their powers—and of the consequences if they fail to unite.

A lawyer with good reason to abhor violence, Irina is wary of her new client, a famous boxer accused of
murder. As a street orphan, Tyr learned to fight for survival and trust no one. Despite their differences, the
two find themselves irresistibly drawn to each other.

With secret forces working both for and against their alliance, Tyr and Irina find themselves on a journey
fraught with danger, betrayal and overwhelming desire. Ultimately the fate of billions rests in the hands and
hearts of two lost souls who must overcome their fears and learn to trust each other.

Reader Advisory: This story has graphic sexual language and scenes—no closed bedroom doors (or other
rooms) here!

A Romantica® urban fantasy erotic romance from Ellora’s Cave
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Wilson:

The knowledge that you get from Calm Before the Storm will be the more deep you digging the information
that hide within the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is
hard to know but Calm Before the Storm giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer
conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by simply anyone who read it because the author of
this reserve is well-known enough. This book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it
easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having
that Calm Before the Storm instantly.

Ellen Farnsworth:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Calm Before the
Storm suitable to you? Often the book was written by renowned writer in this era. The particular book
untitled Calm Before the Stormis one of several books which everyone read now. This book was inspired a
number of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new dimensions that you
ever know before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to
comprehend the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. In
order to see the represented of the world with this book.

Peggy Nunes:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their reader with their story
or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some exploration before they write for their book. One of them is this Calm Before
the Storm.

Denise Rutledge:

The book untitled Calm Before the Storm contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains the
girl idea with easy method. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do definitely not worry, you
can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author brings you in the new era of
literary works. You can read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or program, so
you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their
official web-site and also order it. Have a nice study.
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