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Making Sense of Leasehold Property offers an invaluable source of practical help and advice for the millions
of owners of leasehold property.

Written in plain English, property leasehold expert Kat Callo sets out a step-by-step guide for anyone
wanting to pursue their leaseholder's rights and enhance the value of their leasehold property.

If you own a flat in England or Wales, the chances are that it will be a leasehold property. Leasehold is a
property system virtually unique to England and Wales, with origins dating back 1,000 years. But leasehold
hasn't become any easier to understand for many of us during this time!

Making Sense of Leasehold Property provides a unique and valuable guide through the thickets of leasehold
law, written in simple and practical terms by a flat owner for flat owners.The author is an acknowledged
expert in property leasehold and provides straightforward advice for the millions of owners of leasehold
properties. It covers all the major areas of leasehold law, such as gaining an extension of your lease, making
a purchase of the freehold, or the 'right to manage' legislation.

This guide features:

Disputing your landlord’s service charges●

Gaining the right to manage●

Buying the building’s freehold through ‘collective enfranchisement’●

Negotiated freehold purchases●

Buying a freehold through right of first refusal●

Extending your lease●

Setting up a residents’ association●

Also includes:

Case studies●

Template residents’ association constitution●

Template enfranchisement notice●

Useful contacts●

Valid in England and Wales

'An invaluable source of practical help and advice for owners of leasehold properties. Making Sense of
Leasehold Property highlights how to avoid the pitfalls and increase the chances of success. This book is a
must for all owners of leasehold property.' Lorna Bourke, former Personal Finance Editor of the Daily
Telegraph, The Times and the Independent

'It is really useful to have such an interesting and well-researched book on the leasehold system written by
such a dedicated and well-informed leasehold professional such as Kat Callo. Making Sense of Leasehold



Property will certainly increase the knowledge base in an important way amongst the leaseholders, residents'
associations and resident management companies and amongst other stakeholders in the area of leaseholder
rights.' Robert Levene, Chief Executive, Federation of Private Residents' Associations
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Ramsey:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that
question due to the fact just their can do that. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person.
Yes, it is right. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Making Sense Of
Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights explained to read.

Hilda Dumas:

Do you one among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This Making Sense Of Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights explained book is
readable simply by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable
reading experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer
associated with Making Sense Of Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights explained content conveys the
idea easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just
different as it. So , do you still thinking Making Sense Of Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights explained
is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Gloria Eller:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Making Sense Of
Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights explained that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied
simply by reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for people to know
world much better then how they react to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading behavior
only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for every you who want to
start examining as your good habit, you can pick Making Sense Of Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights
explained become your starter.

Cassandra Sanderson:

This Making Sense Of Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights explained is great reserve for you because
the content and that is full of information for you who all always deal with world and still have to make
decision every minute. This particular book reveal it facts accurately using great manage word or we can
declare no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole data in it.
Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but tricky core information with attractive
delivering sentences. Having Making Sense Of Leasehold Property: Leaseholders' rights explained in your



hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no book that offer you
world in ten or fifteen small right but this reserve already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey
there Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt this?
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