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Considered the best book ever written about Haiti, now updated with a New Introduction, “After the
Earthquake,” features first hand-reporting from Haiti weeks after the 2010 earthquake.

Through a series of personal journeys, each interwoven with scenes from Haiti’s extraordinary past, Amy
Wilentz brings to life this turbulent and fascinating country. Opening with her arrival just days before the fall
of Haiti’s President-for-Life, Jean-Claude “Baby Doc” Duvalier, Wilentz captures a country electric with the
expectation of change: markets that bustle by day explode with gunfire at night; outlaws control country
roads; farmers struggle to survive in a barren land; and belief in voodoo and the spirits of the ancestors
remains as strong as ever.

The Rainy Season demystifies Haiti—a country and a people in cruel and capricious times. From the rebel
priest Father Aristide and the street boys under his protection to the military strongmen who pass through the
revolving door of power into the gleaming white presidential palace—and the buzzing international press
corps members who jet in for a coup and leave the minute it’s over—Wilentz’s Haiti haunts the imagination.
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From reader reviews:

Mildred Yen:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yep,
by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high. For you
personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Rainy Season: Haiti-Then and Now
book as beginning and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Stacie Logan:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book mainly book entitled Rainy
Season: Haiti-Then and Now your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect
that maybe mysterious for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in
a publication then become one web form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get previous
to. The Rainy Season: Haiti-Then and Now giving you an additional experience more than blown away your
brain but also giving you useful facts for your better life within this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing
pattern is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a
casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Virginia Comer:

You can get this Rainy Season: Haiti-Then and Now by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or
reviewing it can to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are
various. Not only through written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era
like now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose
your own personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to
make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose right ways for you.

Dianne Haire:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book and also novel and Rainy Season: Haiti-Then and Now as well as
others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel wish to read
more and more. Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those publications are
helping them to add their knowledge. In other case, beside science guide, any other book likes Rainy Season:
Haiti-Then and Now to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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