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Los pequeños Abu y Abdel juegan juntos por las calles de Garnata. Ambicioso y soberbio, el primero
consigue un trabajo como secretario del visir; generoso y leal el segundo, entra a estudiar farmacopea.
Mucho tiempo después, coinciden de nuevo en Fez, y allí Abu confía a Abdel una misión a cambio de
favores para su familia. Sin embargo, Abdel descubre que su supuesto amigo es un traidor y que además
pretende acabar con su vida, por lo que no lleva a cabo el encargo. Pero Abu, que dirige las obras del gran
palacio de la AlHamra, se entera de que Abdel vive y conoce sus secretos, y decide acabar con él. Los
herederos de Abdel no están dispuestos a dejar las cosas así, y a la sombra del palacio se forjara una
venganza movida por el afán de justicia.
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From reader reviews:

Johnnie McCormick:

Now a day people that Living in the era wherever everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information particularly this El esclavo de la Al-Hamra
(B DE BOOKS) (Spanish Edition) book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course
the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Sally Rose:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with
their story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their talent in writing, they also doing some study before they write for their book. One of them is
this El esclavo de la Al-Hamra (B DE BOOKS) (Spanish Edition).

Michael Marx:

Typically the book El esclavo de la Al-Hamra (B DE BOOKS) (Spanish Edition) has a lot associated with on
it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was authored by the very
famous author. This articles author makes some research ahead of write this book. That book very easy to
read you may get the point easily after reading this book.

Mary Otter:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt it when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book El esclavo de la Al-Hamra (B DE BOOKS)
(Spanish Edition) to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading proficiency is
developing when you including reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to see it and
mingle the feeling about book and reading especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open a
book and go through it. Beside that the book El esclavo de la Al-Hamra (B DE BOOKS) (Spanish Edition)
can to be your brand-new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with the information must you're
doing of this time.
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