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In the years following World War II, American Protestantism experienced tremendous growth, but
conventional wisdom holds that midcentury Protestants practiced an optimistic, progressive, complacent, and
materialist faith. In Original Sin and Everyday Protestants, historian Andrew Finstuen argues against this
prevailing view, showing that theological issues in general--and the ancient Christian doctrine of original sin
in particular--became newly important to both the culture at large and to a generation of American
Protestants during a postwar "age of anxiety" as the Cold War took root.

Finstuen focuses on three giants of Protestant thought--Billy Graham, Reinhold Niebuhr, and Paul Tillich--
men who were among the era's best known public figures. He argues that each thinker's strong commitment
to the doctrine of original sin was a powerful element of the broad public influence that they enjoyed.
Drawing on extensive correspondence from everyday Protestants, the book captures the voices of the people
in the pews, revealing that the ordinary, rank-and-file Protestants were indeed thinking about Christian
doctrine and especially about "good" and "evil" in human nature. Finstuen concludes that the theological
concerns of ordinary American Christians were generally more complicated and serious than is commonly
assumed, correcting the view that postwar American culture was becoming more and more secular from the
late 1940s through the 1950s.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Dealba:

The e-book untitled Original Sin and Everyday Protestants: The Theology of Reinhold Niebuhr, Billy
Graham, and Paul Tillich in an Age of Anxiety is the e-book that recommended to you to see. You can see
the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you actually. The language that article author use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book,
and so the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of
Original Sin and Everyday Protestants: The Theology of Reinhold Niebuhr, Billy Graham, and Paul Tillich
in an Age of Anxiety from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Stephen Beatty:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get wide
range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have read
is usually Original Sin and Everyday Protestants: The Theology of Reinhold Niebuhr, Billy Graham, and
Paul Tillich in an Age of Anxiety.

Kari Annis:

This Original Sin and Everyday Protestants: The Theology of Reinhold Niebuhr, Billy Graham, and Paul
Tillich in an Age of Anxiety is great publication for you because the content and that is full of information
for you who else always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. That book reveal it
information accurately using great manage word or we can say no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read
the idea hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward
sentences but tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Original Sin and Everyday
Protestants: The Theology of Reinhold Niebuhr, Billy Graham, and Paul Tillich in an Age of Anxiety in your
hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no publication that
offer you world throughout ten or fifteen second right but this reserve already do that. So , this really is good
reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?

Lee Villegas:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What
you must do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the
books in the top checklist in your reading list is definitely Original Sin and Everyday Protestants: The
Theology of Reinhold Niebuhr, Billy Graham, and Paul Tillich in an Age of Anxiety. This book that is



certainly qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up
and review this book you can get many advantages.
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