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Risking his neck is all in a day's work… 

Tough and relentless, Cord Romero lives for the adrenaline rush that comes with being a mercenary for hire.
But this time the job is personal. Having barely survived a murder attempt from an elusive enemy, Cord is
determined to neutralize his foe—the head of a multinational corporation that fronts a child labor ring. In
order to get closer to his target, Cord joins forces with the Lassiter Detective Agency, where he's reunited
with his childhood friend Maggie Barton. Maggie is no longer the impressionable young woman he once
knew. She is now strong, independent and in charge of her own life—and, professionally, Cord's equal. She
has one vulnerability: a tragic secret from her past that threatens her relationship with Cord…and sets her up
as a pawn for his deadly enemy. 

Cord cannot afford to be distracted during the most important case of his life. But Maggie plays an
indispensable part in unraveling the links to his enemy's crimes. Forced to trust each other for their very
survival, Cord and Maggie embark on a lethal game of cat and mouse that can leave only one winner
standing.
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From reader reviews:

Marjorie Wright:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yes,
by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is high. In your case
who want to start reading a new book, we give you this specific Desperado (Hutton & Co. Book 5) book as
starter and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Nathaniel Thomas:

This Desperado (Hutton & Co. Book 5) usually are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful
person, why. The key reason why of this Desperado (Hutton & Co. Book 5) can be one of many great books
you must have is giving you more than just simple examining food but feed you actually with information
that perhaps will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it just about
everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Desperado
(Hutton & Co. Book 5) forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you
demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Teresita Donahue:

This Desperado (Hutton & Co. Book 5) is brand new way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information mainly because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more
you know or else you who still having little digest in reading this Desperado (Hutton & Co. Book 5) can be
the light food in your case because the information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone. These
books create itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book application form.
People who think that in book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there
is not any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you
actually. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book type for your better life and also knowledge.

Ralph McClure:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This particular book Desperado (Hutton & Co. Book 5) was
bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Desperado (Hutton & Co. Book 5)
has many kinds or type. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can
read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book tend to be make you bored,
any it offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading
this.
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