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The Good of Recognition analyzes the polysemy of recognition operative in the thought of two contemporary
French thinkers, Emmanuel Lévinas (1906–1995) and Paul Ricœur (1913–2005). Author Michael Sohn
shows that recognition—a concept most often associated with Hegel’s works—appears prominently
throughout the works of Lévinas and Ricœur, which exist at the intersection of phenomenology, ethics,
politics, and religion. Sohn situates recognition in the sociopolitical context of Lévinas and Ricœur and
excavates the philosophical and religious sources that undergird the two thinkers’ use of recognition before
contextualizing recognition within the broader themes of their thought.

By reflecting on phenomenology, ethics, and religion in The Good of Recognition, Sohn not only shows how
Lévinas and Ricœur articulated a response to the pervasive problems of nonrecognition and misrecognition
in their day but also suggests how their thought can contribute to a better understanding of our contemporary
social and political landscape.
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From reader reviews:

Veronica McFadden:

In other case, little people like to read book The Good of Recognition: Phenomenology, Ethics, and Religion
in the Thought of Levinas and Ricoeur. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Given that
we know about how is important any book The Good of Recognition: Phenomenology, Ethics, and Religion
in the Thought of Levinas and Ricoeur. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world
by a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your country till foreign or
abroad you can be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can
open a book or even searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to
go to the library. Let's learn.

Nancy Reese:

This The Good of Recognition: Phenomenology, Ethics, and Religion in the Thought of Levinas and Ricoeur
are usually reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The main reason of this The
Good of Recognition: Phenomenology, Ethics, and Religion in the Thought of Levinas and Ricoeur can be
one of the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed
you with information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it
everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Good of
Recognition: Phenomenology, Ethics, and Religion in the Thought of Levinas and Ricoeur giving you an
enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it useful in
your day exercise. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Megan Fairbanks:

Typically the book The Good of Recognition: Phenomenology, Ethics, and Religion in the Thought of
Levinas and Ricoeur has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a
lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some research before
write this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after scanning this book.

Kelly Breedlove:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family
or just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Good of
Recognition: Phenomenology, Ethics, and Religion in the Thought of Levinas and Ricoeur which is finding
the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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