
Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide
Jonathan Hassell

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B0043D2EKY
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B0043D2EKY
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B0043D2EKY


Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide

Jonathan Hassell

Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide Jonathan Hassell

This practical guide has exactly what you need to work with Windows Server 2008. Inside, you'll find step-
by-step procedures for using all of the major components, along with discussions on complex concepts such
as Active Directory replication, DFS namespaces and replication, network access protection, the Server Core
edition, Windows PowerShell, server clustering, and more. All of this with a more compact presentation and
a tighter focus on tasks than you'll find in bulkier references.

Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide takes a refreshing approach. You won't find the history of
Windows NT, or discussions on the way things used to work. Instead, you get only the information you need
to use this server. If you're a beginning or intermediate system administrator, you learn how the system
works, and how to administer machines running it. The expert administrators among you discover new
concepts and components outside of your realm of expertise.

Simply put, this is the most thorough reference available for Windows Server 2008, with complete guides to:

Installing the server in a variety of different environments●

File services and the Windows permission structure●

How the domain name system (DNS) works●

Active Directory, including its logical and physical structure, hierarchical components, scalability, and●

replication
Group Policy's structure and operation●

Managing security policy with predefined templates and customized policy plans●

Architectural improvements, new features, and daily administration of IIS 7●

Terminal Services from both the administrator's user's point of view●

Networking architecture including DNS, DHCP, VPN, RADIUS server, IAS, and IPSec●

Windows clustering services --- applications, grouping machines, capacity and network planning, user●

account management
Windows PowerShell scripting and command-line technology●

With Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide, you to come away with a firm understanding of what's
happening under the hood, but without the sense that you're taking a graduate course in OS theory. If you
intend to work with this server, this is the only book you need.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Hamlin:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How people have
to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Windows Server 2008: The
Definitive Guide book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the information in this
book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Traci Daniels:

The e-book untitled Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide is the guide that recommended to you to
learn. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that creator use
to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis
when write the book, therefore the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You
also might get the e-book of Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide from the publisher to make you
more enjoy free time.

Nathaniel Marvel:

The reason? Because this Windows Server 2008: The Definitive Guide is an unordinary book that the inside
of the e-book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret the idea inside. Reading
this book close to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such awesome way makes the content
inside of easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot
of positive aspects than the other book have such as help improving your proficiency and your critical
thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Hilton Rogers:

You could spend your free time to study this book this guide. This Windows Server 2008: The Definitive
Guide is simple to deliver you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not include
much space to bring the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You
can save the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.
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