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Revised and updated to include the most current information on same-sex marriage, The Limits to Union
documents a legal struggle at its moment of greatest historical importance.

"The Limits to Union is a superb book about the complexities of recent political struggles over same-sex
marriage. Goldberg-Hiller offers a sophisticated account of egalitarian rights advocacy and the reaction it has
generated from established majorities animated by a 'new common sense' of exclusionary sovereign
authority. The author's analysis is multidimensional and nuanced, but the core argument is bold, important,
and well-supported. I recommend it very highly to everyone interested in understanding the character,
possibilities, and constraints of civil rights amid our contemporary culture wars."

-Michael McCann, author of Rights at Work: Pay Equity Reform and the Politics of Legal Mobilization

"In this excellent book, Goldberg-Hiller uses Hawaii's experience to examine the interaction between courts
and the political system. . . . Relying on briefs, legislative statements, and interviews with activists from both
sides of the question, he views this familiar debate . . . through the unfamiliar prism of gay marriage, which
allows him to gauge the viability and the pliability of the American civil rights ideal, and how gay and
lesbian issues fit (or don't fit) within that ideal."

-Willian Heinzen, New York Law Journal

"Goldberg-Hiller presents the history of the same-sex marriage question since it first sparked debate in
Hawaii. He follows the shifting debate through court cases, state propositions, and state and federal
legislatures, considering questions about the constitutionality of the Defense of Marriage Act and the concept
of equal protection under the law for gays and lesbians. This detailed treatment of the legal issues
surrounding same-sex marriages is highly recommended."

-R. L. Abbott, University of Evansville

"[A] valuable contribution to the field, situating the gay marriage debate in broader contexts of theory, law
and practice. [S]ame-sex marriage is an important issue...that finds itself caught in the friction points of



much larger debates over the nature of rights, the limits of sovereignty and the proper role of courts and law
in a democratic society. The Limits to Union should therefore be of interest even to those who do not think of
themselves as interested in gay and lesbian rights issues."

-Evan Gerstmann, Loyola Marymount University, Law and Politics Book Review
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From reader reviews:

Dale Winsett:

The e-book with title The Limits to Union: Same-Sex Marriage and the Politics of Civil Rights (Law,
Meaning, And Violence) has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read
this book. This particular book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this guide represented the
condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the
world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the internationalization. You can read the
e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Richard Byrnes:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this book. This The Limits to Union: Same-Sex Marriage
and the Politics of Civil Rights (Law, Meaning, And Violence) is simple to create you can read it in the
recreation area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not possess much space to bring often the
printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save often the book in
your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Michael Green:

This The Limits to Union: Same-Sex Marriage and the Politics of Civil Rights (Law, Meaning, And
Violence) is brand-new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information given it relief
your hunger details. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having little digest in reading this The Limits to Union: Same-Sex Marriage and the Politics of Civil Rights
(Law, Meaning, And Violence) can be the light food in your case because the information inside that book is
easy to get through anyone. These books produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean
in the e-book contact form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this
book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find what you are
looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book style for your better
life along with knowledge.

Candace Mathieu:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And
you also know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by
book. Amount types of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is The Limits to
Union: Same-Sex Marriage and the Politics of Civil Rights (Law, Meaning, And Violence).
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