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Exhibiting both homogeneous and heterogeneous catalytic properties, nanocatalysts allow for rapid and
selective chemical transformations, with the benefits of excellent product yield and ease of catalyst
separation and recovery. This book reviews the catalytic performance and the synthesis and characterization
of nanocatalysts, examining the current state of the art and pointing the way towards new avenues of
research. Moreover, the authors discuss new and emerging applications of nanocatalysts and nanocatalysis,
from pharmaceuticals to fine chemicals to renewable energy to biotransformations.

Nanocatalysis features contributions from leading research groups around the world. These contributions
reflect a thorough review of the current literature as well as the authors’ first-hand experience designing and
synthesizing nanocatalysts and developing new applications for them. The book’s nineteen chapters offer a
broad perspective, covering:

Nanocatalysis for carbon-carbon and carbon-heteroatom coupling reactions●

Nanocatalysis for various organic transformations in fine chemical synthesis●

Nanocatalysis for oxidation, hydrogenation, and other related reactions●

Nanomaterial-based photocatalysis and biocatalysis●

Nanocatalysts to produce non-conventional energy such as hydrogen and biofuels●

Nanocatalysts and nano-biocatalysts in the chemical industry●

Readers will also learn about the latest spectroscopic and microscopy tools used in advanced characterization
methods that shed new light on nanocatalysts and nanocatalysis. Moreover, the authors offer expert advice to
help readers develop strategies to improve catalytic performance.

Summarizing and reviewing all the most important advances in nanocatalysis over the last two decades, this
book explains the many advantages of nanocatalysts over conventional homogeneous and heterogeneous
catalysts, providing the information and guidance needed for designing green, sustainable catalytic
processes.
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From reader reviews:

Bobby Griffin:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be upgrade about what going on or info even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Nanocatalysis: Synthesis and Applications is
our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and
need in this era.

Kelley Thornton:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Nanocatalysis: Synthesis and
Applications guide written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas
and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation Nanocatalysis:
Synthesis and Applications as good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is one
publication that can break don't assess book by its handle, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to
pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to an
additional sixth sense.

Kristine Toomey:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you
examine a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, along with soon. The Nanocatalysis: Synthesis and Applications will give you new experience in
studying a book.

Mary Wright:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you are related is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the books in the
top list in your reading list is definitely Nanocatalysis: Synthesis and Applications. This book that is certainly
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking right up and
review this publication you can get many advantages.
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