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This book examines the role of popular culture in the construction of gendered identities in contemporary
society. It draws on a wide range of popular cultural forms - including popular music, newspapers and
television - to illustrate how femininity and masculinity are produced, represented and consumed.

The authors blend primary and secondary research to offer the reader a balanced yet novel overview of the
area. Students are introduced to key theories and concepts in the fields of gender studies and popular culture,
which are made accessible and interesting through their application to topical examples such as DJs, binge
drinking and computer games.

The book is structured into three clear, user-friendly sections:

1. Production, gender and popular culture: An investigation of who produces popular culture, why gendered
patterns occur, and how they impact on content.

2. Representation, gender and popular culture: An examination of how men and women are represented in
contemporary popular culture, and how notions of (in)appropriate femininity and masculinity are
constructed.

3. Consumption, gender and popular culture: An exploration of who consumes what in popular culture, how
gendered consumption relates to space, and what the effects of consuming representations of gender are.

Gender and Popular Culture will be essential reading for students and scholars of media and cultural studies
at all levels.
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From reader reviews:

Philip Logan:

The guide untitled Gender and Popular Culture is the guide that recommended to you to learn. You can see
the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you. The language that writer use to explained their
way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the
book, so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book
of Gender and Popular Culture from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

David Patton:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or all their
friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic from the park.
They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book could be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The first
thing you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to test look for book, may be the
e-book untitled Gender and Popular Culture can be good book to read. May be it is usually best activity to
you.

Delores Nault:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you need to do
is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of books in
the top listing in your reading list is actually Gender and Popular Culture. This book and that is qualified as
The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this e-book
you can get many advantages.

Myra Coronado:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or
real their passion. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently
there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know
that on this era, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this Gender and Popular Culture can make you sense more interested to read.
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