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War, poverty, and famine; political, social, and economic change; and the deep seated views and rituals
rooted in a culture’s history and traditions all contribute to the widespread and growing trafficking of women
and children.  The multilayered complexity, myriad contributing factors, enormous amount of money
involved, and sheer magnitude of the problem render it impossible to solve with the fractured and isolated
measures of individual organizations and countries. Only complete cooperation and collaboration at all levels
can establish the most proactive and self-sustaining approach to reduce this global crime.

Gathering knowledge and experience from more than 40 countries, Global Trafficking in Women and
Children clearly demonstrates the scale and spread of the problem, providing a powerful analysis of the
circumstances that contribute to the abuse and victimization of women and children as well as the
international policies and strategies used to combat this crime. Divided into two parts, the book begins with
an introduction to the definition, nature, and scope of human trafficking. It discusses several social theories
as well as evident environmental influences. It also examines measures to control and prevent human
trafficking from stricter laws and monetary aid, to global community and law enforcement collaboration.

Part 2 consists of case studies, drawing examples from a range of countries involved in every stage in the
process, and highlighting the unique characteristics of human trafficking in each. Chapters include the
prevalence of child pornography in Japan, child abduction in China, bonded child labor in India, and child
soldiering in Congo (Zaire) and other African countries. The final chapters discuss law enforcement in the
US and UK, community policing in Australia, and the cooperative national plan in place in Croatia.
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From reader reviews:

Jaime Worm:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy particular person? If you
don't have spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They must answer that question
simply because just their can do this. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
proper. Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Global Trafficking in Women
and Children to read.

Jerry Raminez:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This Global Trafficking in
Women and Children is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

Blake Nixon:

The particular book Global Trafficking in Women and Children will bring you to the new experience of
reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to
study, this book very suited to you. The book Global Trafficking in Women and Children is much
recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read
the book.

Rana Jensen:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Global Trafficking in Women and
Children e-book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who all read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet
every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty
Global Trafficking in Women and Children as good book not just by the cover but also with the content. This
is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing yet another sixth
sense to pick this!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening
to one more sixth sense.
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