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Lawrence H. Konecny and Clinton Machann take readers beyond the bare facts to the human stories of
immigration from the point of view of English and Czech immigrants whose tales provide fascinating
counterpoints to each other and to the glowing claims about Texas made in William Kingsbury’s pamphlet.
Perilous Voyages combines the original text of Kingsbury’s 1877 pamphlet, a private diary kept by an
Englishman named William Wright, and oral histories by descendants of Moravian immigrants to allow
modern readers to experience some of the lure that brought people to the state in earlier days.

The first part of the book includes a complete reprint of Kingsbury’s pamphlet, today a rare document,
giving insight into the historical context and rhetoric of Texas immigration. The realities faced by the early
settlers stand in sharp relief to Kingsbury’s sometimes extravagant claims. In the second part, the
experiences of the immigrants themselves are illuminated through Wright’s private diary. His 1879 journey
began with a shipwreck off the coast of Spain, but, undaunted, he continued in another ship and eventually
was able to record his first–hand impressions of the land and people of Texas. The third section of the book
narrates the story of a group of thirty-six men, women, and children that left their rural Moravian homeland
in 1873 to pursue dreams of prosperity and the good life in Texas. Their ship ran aground in the Bahamas,
and they were left to ride out a terrible hurricane before continuing to Galveston and, finally, to the peaceful
farmlands of central Texas.

The experiences of the English and Czech immigrants are vividly recounted here; the two stories share hopes
and perils, hardships and enthusiasms. Kingsbury’s pamphlet gives insight into the sparsely settled region
and the dreams that led not only to the cultivation of the land but eventually to the cities that now rise from
once-barren plains of Texas.
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From reader reviews:

James Lightle:

The book Perilous Voyages: Czech and English Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the
Association of Former Students, Texas A&M University) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
should use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting
stress or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book Perilous Voyages: Czech
and English Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the Association of Former Students,
Texas A&M University) to get your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your own
personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if
you like open up and read a guide Perilous Voyages: Czech and English Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s
(Centennial Series of the Association of Former Students, Texas A&M University). Kinds of book are a lot
of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this
reserve?

Laura Buscher:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Perilous Voyages: Czech and English
Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the Association of Former Students, Texas A&M
University) guide written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which can be
understand by anyone who read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas
and producing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still uncertainty Perilous Voyages: Czech
and English Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the Association of Former Students,
Texas A&M University) as good book but not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one e-
book that can break don't determine book by its cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick
that!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Charlotte Neville:

This Perilous Voyages: Czech and English Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the
Association of Former Students, Texas A&M University) is completely new way for you who has
fascination to look for some information because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you in it
getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little digest in reading this Perilous
Voyages: Czech and English Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the Association of
Former Students, Texas A&M University) can be the light food for you because the information inside this
specific book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books create itself in the form which is reachable by
anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in publication form make them feel tired even
dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is not any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find
what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book kind for
your better life in addition to knowledge.



Jerry Schooler:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This Perilous Voyages: Czech and English Immigrants to
Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the Association of Former Students, Texas A&M University) can
give you a lot of friends because by you checking out this one book you have factor that they don't and make
a person more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of one step for you to get success.
This e-book offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than different
make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We should have Perilous Voyages: Czech and English
Immigrants to Texas in the 1870s (Centennial Series of the Association of Former Students, Texas A&M
University).
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