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This follow-up to A Spiritual Renegade’s Guide to the Good Life calls for the biggest revolution of all: the
overthrow of our obsessive quest to be somebody.

Like boardwalk tourists poking their faces through two-dimensional cutouts of the muscle man and bathing
beauty, we are all desperately trying to be somebody, to be “special.” No one wants to be a loser, a small fry,
a big zero.

But maybe we’ve got it all wrong.

With an edgy tone and radical perspective, Lama Marut shows that the quest to distinguish ourselves is the
true cause of our dissatisfaction, and it continually leaves us feeling isolated and alone. Drawing from the
spiritual truism that only by losing the self can we discover our real potential, Be Nobody provides guidance,
actions, and simple meditations to help you lay down the heavy burden of trying to be somebody—without
requiring you to live in a monastery or retire to a cave in the Himalayas. When we vacate ourselves, we will
finally have the freedom to find true fulfillment.

So stop narrating your life and start living it. Be nobody.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Marsh:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Studying a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Be Nobody book since this book
offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there
is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Raymond Simmons:

This Be Nobody is fresh way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief
your hunger of information. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having little bit of digest in reading this Be Nobody can be the light food for yourself because the
information inside this kind of book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form
that is certainly reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in book
form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a e-book
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the item! Just
read this e-book style for your better life as well as knowledge.

Mia Shaw:

Reserve is one of source of understanding. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen require book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. By
the book Be Nobody we can get more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To be creative person
must choose to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't be doubt to
change your life at this time book Be Nobody. You can more desirable than now.

Brooke Lambeth:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source that filled update of
news. In this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the Be Nobody when you desired it?
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