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Cremona violins occupy a unique and storied place in violin history. This book contains a brief account of
that history — the rise and fall of the Cremonese art of violin making that dominated over two centuries. It is
primarily devoted, however, to the physics behind violin acoustics, specifically the research of William F
“Jack” Fry over the past several decades. The gradual evolution of his ideas leading to a holistic approach is
chronicled, in sharp contrast to the conventional “reductionist” analysis. With rare insights, he has come
closer than anyone before in reproducing the tonal qualities of the great Italian masters. This historic
achievement makes the book extremely valuable for violin makers and violin researchers, enabling young
and aspiring violinists to own excellent sounding instruments with the acoustical marvels of the old at
affordable prices.

The accompanying video features Fry's demonstration of how and why minute changes in thickness
graduations make predictable changes in tonal qualities of an instrument.

Contents:

Luigi Tarisio and the Violins of Cremona●

The Rise and Fall of the Cremonese Art of Violin Making Antonio Stradivari (1644c–1737)●

The Anatomy of a Violin and the Mechanism of Sound Production●

Some Historical Notes on Violin Research Over Centuries●

William F Fry and His Quest for the Secrets of Cremona Violins●

Myth and Reality of Cremona Violins, Fry's Violins●

A Convergence of Science and Art●

Readership: Physicists, musicologists, violin makers and violin researchers.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Olive:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Cremona Violins:A Physicist's
Quest for the Secrets of Stradivari(With DVD-ROM) which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try
out this book? Let's notice.

Millard Lopez:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Cremona Violins:A Physicist's Quest for
the Secrets of Stradivari(With DVD-ROM) can be the solution, oh how comes? A book you know. You are
and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So
what these guides have than the others?

Gladys Jackson:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but additionally novel and Cremona Violins:A Physicist's Quest for
the Secrets of Stradivari(With DVD-ROM) or maybe others sources were given know-how for you. After
you know how the good a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science guide was created for
teacher as well as students especially. Those guides are helping them to include their knowledge. In
additional case, beside science publication, any other book likes Cremona Violins:A Physicist's Quest for the
Secrets of Stradivari(With DVD-ROM) to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like
this one.

Alexandra Stafford:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the book Cremona Violins:A Physicist's Quest for the
Secrets of Stradivari(With DVD-ROM) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of
reading ability is developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to read
it and mingle the feeling about book and studying especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to start a
book and go through it. Beside that the reserve Cremona Violins:A Physicist's Quest for the Secrets of
Stradivari(With DVD-ROM) can to be your new friend when you're feel alone and confuse with what must
you're doing of this time.
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