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For thirty years, beginning with Fresh Bread in 1985, Joyce Rupp has comforted millions with such books as
Praying Our Goodbyes and May I Walk You Home?. For the first time, she shares the story of her own grief
in the wake of her mother’s death, offering readers both a profile of her mother’s resilient spirit and a voice
of compassion for their own experience of loss.

In this heartfelt memoir about her mother Hilda’s final years, Joyce Rupp shares the lessons her mother
taught her, especially to “fly while you still have wings.” As a poor farmer’s wife and the mother of eight
living on rented land in Maryhill, Iowa, Hilda lived a life of hard labor and constant responsibility—from
milking cows and raising chickens to keeping the farm’s financial ledger. Rupp shows how the difficulties of
her mother’s early years and family life, including the loss of a twenty-three-year-old son, forged a resilience
that guided her through the illnesses and losses she faced in later years. This affectionate profile of their
relationship is, at the same time, an honest self-examination, as Rupp shares the ways she sometimes failed
to listen to, accept, and understand her mother in her final years.

Rupp begins each chapter with a meditative poem that captures the essence of each stage in the journey. Her
unfailing candor and profound faith illumine this story of a mother and daughter with a universal spirit of
hope, reconciliation, and peace.
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From reader reviews:

Stephanie Matias:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or thinking
skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with can satisfy your
limited time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more time to be examine. Fly
While You Still Have Wings: And Other Lessons My Resilient Mother Taught Me can be your answer since
it can be read by a person who have those short spare time problems.

Beth Sanders:

The book untitled Fly While You Still Have Wings: And Other Lessons My Resilient Mother Taught Me
contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is
very straightforward all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read it. The book was
published by famous author. The author gives you in the new period of time of literary works. It is possible
to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book within
anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-
site and order it. Have a nice learn.

Gary Williams:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Fly While You Still Have Wings:
And Other Lessons My Resilient Mother Taught Me which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out
this book? Let's observe.

Keith Robertson:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This book Fly While You Still Have Wings: And Other Lessons My Resilient Mother
Taught Me was filled concerning science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your science
competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of
a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you
wanted.
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