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Research results over the past decades have consistently demonstrated that a key reason why many second
language learners fail--while some learners do better with less effort--lies in various learner attributes such as
personality traits, motivation, or language aptitude. In psychology, these attributes have traditionally been
called "individual differences." The scope of individual learner differences is broad--ranging from creativity
to learner styles and anxiety--yet there is no current, comprehensive, and unified volume that provides an
overview of the considerable amount of research conducted on various language learner differences, until
now.

Each chapter in this new volume focuses on a different individual difference variable. Besides a review of
the relevant second language literature, Zoltán Dörnyei presents a concise overview of the psychological
research involving each topic. A key concern for the author has been to define the various learner factors as
measurable constructs and therefore the discussion includes a summary of the most famous tests and
questionnaires in each domain.

A wide range of readers will benefit from this book--students in linguistics, applied linguistics, modern
languages, and psychology programs; second language teachers participating in in-service training courses;
and researchers in second language acquisition and psychology.
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From reader reviews:

David Goodspeed:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic inside the
park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The
first thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to try out look for
book, may be the guide untitled The Psychology of the Language Learner: Individual Differences in Second
Language Acquisition (Second Language Acquisition Research Series) can be excellent book to read. May
be it is usually best activity to you.

Shawn Hernandez:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try thing that really opposite from that.
One particular activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Psychology of the Language
Learner: Individual Differences in Second Language Acquisition (Second Language Acquisition Research
Series), you are able to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-
out type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified
as reading friends.

Naomi Harris:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Psychology of the
Language Learner: Individual Differences in Second Language Acquisition (Second Language Acquisition
Research Series) which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.

Raymond Jackson:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book and also novel and The Psychology of the Language Learner: Individual
Differences in Second Language Acquisition (Second Language Acquisition Research Series) or even others
sources were given information for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel desire to read more
and more. Science guide was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to add
their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes The Psychology of the Language



Learner: Individual Differences in Second Language Acquisition (Second Language Acquisition Research
Series) to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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