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In a film career that spanned more than seven decades, Freddie Francis distinguished himself as both an
award-winning cinematographer and as a director of classic British horror films of the 1960s and 70s. From
his formative years as a clapperboy and camera assistant in the 1930s to his work as camera operator,
director of photography, and director through the 1990s, Francis had a unique behind-the-scenes perspective
on filmmaking, particular British cinema. Throughout his career, Francis was honored with several BAFTA
nominations and received Academy Awards for Sons and Lovers and Glory.

Freddie Francis: The Straight Story from Moby Dick to Glory, a Memoir is a personal story by one of the
great British filmmakers of the 20th century. In this engaging volume, Francis provides a firsthand account
of working on such classics as The Small Back Room, Beat the Devil, Room at the Top, Saturday Night and
Sunday Morning, The Elephant Man, The French Lieutenant’s Woman, Cape Fear, and The Straight Story.
He also reveals what is was like to work with some of the most significant filmmakers on both sides of the
Atlantic, including Carol Reed, René Clair, Michael Powell, Emeric Pressberger, John Huston, Karel Reisz,
Robert Mulligan, Jack Clayton, Martin Scorsese, and David Lynch. With his own brand of humor and charm,
Francis recounts his career as a director for the British horror studios Hammer Films and its chief rival,
Amicus Productions.

Freddie Francis's memoir provides an insider's view of the British Film industry from the mid-1930s to the
1990s. As such, it will appeal to both scholars of cinema and anyone interested in the golden age of
filmmaking in the latter half of the twentieth century.
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From reader reviews:

Elsie Canada:

The book Freddie Francis: The Straight Story from Moby Dick to Glory, a Memoir has a lot associated with
on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very
famous author. Tom makes some research before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you
may get the point easily after reading this article book.

David Gaytan:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specially book entitled Freddie
Francis: The Straight Story from Moby Dick to Glory, a Memoir your mind will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will end up your mind
friends. Imaging each and every word written in a guide then become one web form conclusion and
explanation that will maybe you never get previous to. The Freddie Francis: The Straight Story from Moby
Dick to Glory, a Memoir giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also
giving you useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern
this is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a
casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Katrina Frey:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for your requirements is Freddie Francis: The Straight Story from Moby Dick to Glory, a
Memoir this reserve consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This particular book
was represented how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. The writer made some study when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Martin Williams:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got students? We believe that that question
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by book. Many kinds of
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Freddie Francis: The Straight Story from Moby
Dick to Glory, a Memoir.
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