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When Canadian teen Delora James finds herself banished to Germany for the summer, reading the
professor's old journals seems like a good time- waster. Once Del begins to read the translated diary of Garda
- a teenager in World War II, pregnant and desperate - she is engaged by Garda's compelling story. Through
a series of rebellions, she begins to draw similarities between her own world and Garda's, and is able to see
past her own hostility. Sixteen-year-old Delora has been shipped off to Hamburg, Germany to live with her
controlling sister. Her 'behaviour' at home has caused considerable concern so she is under house arrest till
she proves she can behave otherwise. Through her sister, she meets an English professor who asks her advice
on a book she is working on. Del then encounters 16-year-old Garda, whose journals make up the professor's
story. Del is transported back to Nazi Germany in the Fall of 1942, is riveted by Garda's story and draws
parallels not only between the places they reside but in the oppression they both feel. Garda's rape by a
member of the Hilter youth, the subsquent pregancy and enstrangement from her family resonate with the
reader and with Del. We are presented with the horrors of the Nazi regime through the eyes of an innocent
girl. It is a strong dose of life for Del and mirrors so many of her conflicts. As Garda breaks free of her
oppression, Del finds strength and acceptance of her world and those who love her.
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From reader reviews:

Marilyn Vance:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled Summer of Fire. Try to stumble through book Summer of Fire as your
close friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside that of course
make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more
confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let us make new experience and knowledge
with this book.

Jose Gower:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed Summer of Fire?
Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's
book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have other opinion?

Mathew Jones:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will
make a professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended for your requirements is Summer of Fire this publication consist a lot of the information
in the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the world has grown up. The
terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis
when he makes this book. This is why this book appropriate all of you.

Robert Higby:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Summer of Fire can be the solution, oh
how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand new
era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?
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