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Modern logistics comprises operative logistics, analytical logistics and management of logistic networks.
Central task of operative logistics is the efficient supply of required goods at the right place within the right
time. Tasks of analytical logistics are designing optimal networks and systems, developing strategies for
planning, scheduling and operation, and organizing efficient order and performance processes. Logistic
management plans, implements and operates logistic networks and schedules orders, stocks and resources.

This reference-book offers a unique survey of modern logistics. It contains proven strategies, rules and tools
for the solution of a multitude of logistic problems. The analytically derived algorithms and formulas can be
used for the computer-based planning of logistic systems and for the dynamic scheduling of orders and
resources in supply networks. They enable significant improvements of performance, quality and costs. Their
application is demonstrated by several examples from industry, trade and service providers.

Apart from corrections and modifications the second edition contains a new chapter on maritime logistics. It
demonstrates how the methods of this book can be used to solve complex logistic problems of practical
relevance for economy, society and environment.

The book is written for professionals, scientists, teachers and graduate students. An extensive index makes it
a dictionary of modern logistics.
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From reader reviews:

Anita Pfeifer:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for all of us. The book Comprehensive Logistics seemed to be
making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The reserve Comprehensive Logistics is not only giving you more new information but
also being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your book.
Try to make relationship using the book Comprehensive Logistics. You never really feel lose out for
everything when you read some books.

Larry Witcher:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Comprehensive Logistics book is readable by simply you who hate the perfect word
style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving even
decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer regarding Comprehensive Logistics content
conveys objective easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the
content but it just different as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Comprehensive Logistics is not loveable to
be your top list reading book?

David Swanson:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name Comprehensive
Logistics suitable to you? The actual book was written by well known writer in this era. Typically the book
untitled Comprehensive Logisticsis the main one of several books this everyone read now. This particular
book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new age that
you ever know prior to. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can
easily to recognise the core of this guide. This book will give you a wide range of information about this
world now. So you can see the represented of the world with this book.

Shawn Mathison:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news. In this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking
the Comprehensive Logistics when you necessary it?
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