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Discover a simple technique that creates striking and original results. Using basic metal punch tools--dots
and lines--author Aisha Formanski brings a fresh approach to jewelry-making inspired by Mexican stamped
tin mirrors. Styles range from direct references to the Mexican folk art that first inspired her to geometric
patterns that resemble tin ceilings or printed fabric to designs that look like Japanese sashiko or other
embroidery.

In addition to Aisha's stamping and design techniques, enjoy tutorials on basic metalworking skills:

Riveting●

Creating holes●

Shaping●

Antiquing●

Basic polishing●

And filing●

Aisha focuses on inexpensive metals such as copper, brass, and nickel and shows how to create basic punch
designs with just one stamp. She then demonstrates how the same design can be elaborated using two, three,
or more different punches. The design possibilities are endless!
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From reader reviews:

Michele Stein:

Book is usually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can know everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve New Directions in Punched Metal
Jewelry: 20 Clever and Easy Stamped Projects will make you to be smarter. You can feel much more
confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think in which open or reading any
book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you in search of best
book or suited book with you?

Michael Mitchell:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking New Directions in Punched Metal
Jewelry: 20 Clever and Easy Stamped Projects that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by
simply reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to
know world better then how they react towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading habit
only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who
want to start reading as your good habit, you may pick New Directions in Punched Metal Jewelry: 20 Clever
and Easy Stamped Projects become your starter.

Robin Adams:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in
the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer could be New Directions in Punched Metal Jewelry: 20
Clever and Easy Stamped Projects why because the great cover that make you consider concerning the
content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your
reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Nancy Stever:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This publication New Directions in Punched Metal Jewelry: 20 Clever and Easy
Stamped Projects was filled about science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your
technology competence. Some people has various feel when they reading any book. If you know how big
selling point of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like at this point, many ways
to get book that you just wanted.
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