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Google’s has proved to be one of the most successful business models in today’s knowledge economy. Its
services and applications have become part of our day-to-day life. However, Google has repeatedly been
accused of acting outside the law in the development of services such as Adwords, Googlebooks or
YouTube. One of the main purposes of this book is to assess whether those accusations are well-founded.
But more important than that, this book provides a deeper reflection: are current legal systems adapted to
business models such as that of Google or are they conceived for an industrial economy? Do the various
lawsuits involving Google show an evolution of the existing legal framework that might favour the
flourishing of other knowledge-economy businesses? Or do they simply reflect that Google has gone too far?
What lessons can other knowledge-based businesses learn from all the disputes in which Google has been or
is involved?
This book is valuable reading for legal practitioners and academics in the field of information technologies
and intellectual property law, economists interested in knowledge-economy business models and sociologists
interested in internet and social networks.
Dr. Aurelio Lopez-Tarruella is Senior Lecturer in Private International Law at the University of Alicante,
Spain.
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From reader reviews:

Sergio Espinoza:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What
did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that question since just their can
do that will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on
guardería until university need this particular Google and the Law: Empirical Approaches to Legal Aspects
of Knowledge-Economy Business Models: 22 (Information Technology and Law Series) to read.

Billy Taylor:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to
an individual is you don't know what one you should start with. This Google and the Law: Empirical
Approaches to Legal Aspects of Knowledge-Economy Business Models: 22 (Information Technology and
Law Series) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

Ella McCoy:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than
can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find publication that
need more time to be go through. Google and the Law: Empirical Approaches to Legal Aspects of
Knowledge-Economy Business Models: 22 (Information Technology and Law Series) can be your answer as
it can be read by you actually who have those short spare time problems.

James Holmes:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book Google and the Law: Empirical Approaches to Legal
Aspects of Knowledge-Economy Business Models: 22 (Information Technology and Law Series) was bright
colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Google and the Law: Empirical
Approaches to Legal Aspects of Knowledge-Economy Business Models: 22 (Information Technology and
Law Series) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Private
investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be
make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you and
try to like reading in which.
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