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An in-depth look at the tools, techniques, and tactics used in computer forensics
The New Forensics introduces readers to the world of business forensics, using interesting vignettes,
interviews, and actual crime reports. It examines recent cases in which the use of computer forensics led to
evidence linking executives to fraud and covers issues such as the theft of trade secrets, the use of data
mining, money laundering, and other types of theft and fraud. Author Joe Anastasi, a well-respected leader in
computer and business forensics, leads the reader on a shadowy journey through top-secret government
offices and real-life business investigations while covering the moral and legal issues surrounding corporate
crime. Case studies, stories, and interviews help highlight important issues and move the book out of the
theoretical into the realm of actual practice.
Joe Anastasi (San Francisco, CA) serves as the Global Leader for Deloitte Forensics, which includes the
operation of several Cybercrime Computer Forensics labs located around the world. He is a member of the
High-Tech Crime Investigation Association and the Association of Certified Fraud Examiners.
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From reader reviews:

William Prentice:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication The New Forensics:
Investigating Corporate Fraud and the Theft of Intellectual Property will make you to possibly be smarter.
You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think this open
or reading a book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you
seeking best book or acceptable book with you?

Reva Morison:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to an individual is you don't know which one you should start with. This The New
Forensics: Investigating Corporate Fraud and the Theft of Intellectual Property is our recommendation so
you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Anna Chew:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
skill in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to their book. One of them is this The
New Forensics: Investigating Corporate Fraud and the Theft of Intellectual Property.

Glenn Bail:

The New Forensics: Investigating Corporate Fraud and the Theft of Intellectual Property can be one of your
beginner books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this guide has good
vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still
delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to put every word into delight arrangement in
writing The New Forensics: Investigating Corporate Fraud and the Theft of Intellectual Property however
doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource information
that maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into new stage of crucial
contemplating.
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