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Vancouver's streetscapes and neighbourhoods have changed drastically in recent years. New buildings
representing current architectural trends are mixing with and often replacing those of earlier eras and tastes,
and a maturing architectrual melange is emerging. This book invites the reader to explore the city's
continually evolving urban landscape in a highly readable, yet authoritative, guide to its architecture.

In this completely updated edition of Exploring Vancouver, with brand-new entries and accompanying
photographs, Harold Kalman and Robin Ward have divided the city (including the North Shore, Richmond,
Burnaby and New Westminster) into fourteen areas, selecting buildings and structures in these
neighbourhoods that represent the best exakmples of the new and old architecture. Each area is preceded by
an informative introduction that provides historical context for the entries that follow.

There are over 400 entries, each featuring a short description that combines architectural, historical and
social commentary. The prose is lively as the authors consider the new and the old, the modest and the grand,
the attractive and the not-so-attractive in a wide-ranging work that encompasses everything from heritage to
"monster" homes.

This book is designed as a walking tour guide, with a map of each area showing the location of every entry.
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From reader reviews:

Beverly McKeever:

The book with title Exploring Vancouver: The Architectural Guide has a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at this point. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you inside
new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you
want.

Nelson Gendron:

Typically the book Exploring Vancouver: The Architectural Guide has a lot associated with on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous
author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you
can get the point easily after reading this article book.

Roxie Jenkins:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than
can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more
time to be learn. Exploring Vancouver: The Architectural Guide can be your answer as it can be read by
anyone who have those short time problems.

Teresa Burns:

The book untitled Exploring Vancouver: The Architectural Guide contain a lot of information on the idea.
The writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is very straightforward all the people, so
do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author
provides you in the new period of time of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read on
your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can available their official web-site and order it. Have a nice read.
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